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INTRODUCING Always Sunday - A colour drenched proudly 
independent store in Bath
Always Sunday began as a supper club for creative people with founder Lexi Wareham-Dart 
hosting shoppable events in her own home in Bath, May 2018.

We are now an independent homewares store, three luxury cottages to stay in Bath and a pub and 
restaurant serving the best Sunday roast in Bath!

“Always Sunday is… .that Sunday morning feeling when you wake up to breakfast in bed, 
surrounded by beautiful things, your favourite person and the delicious potential of the day ahead.”

-Lexi Wareham-Dart, Founder & Creative Director of Always Sunday

We love Small Makers..

When Always Sunday Store first opened we always knew we wanted to showcase the best small, 
local makers - the talented artists that you won’t find in your average homewares store. From our 
‘leather guy’ contact at Newdile Studio who creates bespoke pieces for our store and boltholes to the 
cult favourite ceramicist Hana Karim that we’ve stocked since the very beginning, each of our small 
makers is an actual human behind the art and we work to curate strong, long lasting relationships 
with each maker.

SOME OF OUR SMALL MAKERS

HLW Ceramics - Handmade in Surrey by Hayley using nature-inspired glazes. Available as: Butter 
Dish, Spoon Rest, Candle Holder

Superfluities - Handmade in the UK, frilly-edged ceramics in pastel hues by Catherine of 
Superfluities Available as: Match Strikers, Candle Holders.

Newdile Studio - Handmade leatherwork by Newdile Studio, Bath using traditional Italia, and 
modern British techniques. Available as: Wallets, Crossbody Bags, Hat Holders and Playing Card 
Holders

Hana Karim - Organic shaped tableware in nature-inspired colours handmade in Ljubliana, 
Slovenia. Available as: Bowls, Small Bowls, Platters, Small Platters

Stephen Bishop - Bath-based ceramicist who never makes the same shape or colour of ceramics 
more than once. Available as: Mugs, Bowls and Plates IN-STORE ONLY

Oi Soi Oi Lighting - Designed in Denmark and handmade in Vietnam using the finest Vietnamese 
silks. Available as: Round, Oval, Large Oval, Pumpkin, Lotus, UFO and Top Hat ceiling shade 
silhouettes



Storeys & Tails - Luxury pet accessories handcrafted in Devon using the finest materials and solid 
brass hardware. Available as: Leads and collars

Dagny - Design studio based in Denmark creating ornate and luxurious soft furnishings. Available 
as: Rectangular, Square and Large Square cushions

Westley - British pet accessory brand creating beautiful and durable dog-walking gear. Available as: 
Collars, Leads, Harnesses, Pouches, Bags

Smith & Goat - London-based design studio creating homewares and home accessories from 
coloured concrete. Available as: Dog bowls

PRODUCTS DESIGNED BY ALWAYS SUNDAY

ENAMELWARE BY ALWAYS SUNDAY

When we opened the doors to our luxury accommodation, the Always Sunday Boltholes, we 
realised that regular crockery just wouldn't do. Our guests needed something that was both 
absolutely beautiful and also incredibly hardwearing to be used day after day in all sorts of ways. 
The very best enamelware comes from Denizli in Turkey where artisans have been using the same 
tried and tested techniques for generations. We've worked with them to create a colour coordinated 
collection of enamelware that can mix and match in any home style. Each piece is dishwasher, oven 
and freezer proof and stamped with the Always Sunday signature on the bottom. Our designs are 
made in small batches with limited runs so we only ever have a certain amount of each colour way.

CANDLES BY ALWAYS SUNDAY

Find your new favourite scent with our exclusive scented candles, poured by hand in London, UK 
using vegan soy wax and paraben free oils and packaged with the signature Always Sunday seal. 
Each fragrance has been handpicked by Lexi and her team with iconic names like ‘Lick Me (no not 
really)‘ ,’Man of My Dreams‘ ,’Miss Havisham’ and ‘Garden Party at the Royal Crescent’.

We are more than a store, we are..

THE BOLTHOLES | Luxury Accommodation in Bath

Each of our luxury accommodation spots in the city centre is centrally located and expertly thought 
out with its own signature colour and Always Sunday homewares to ensure you have everything 
you need while exploring Bath and the surrounding areas.

Daylily Cottage - Centrally located, but cosy. This 2 bed historic cottage features dramatic Divine 
Savages wallpaper, traditional Georgian features and packed with Always Sunday homewares with 
a daylily green theme. Just a 10 minutes walk from The Roman Baths & Bath Abbey and 
Town+House pub, you can take a casual stroll or pop for a meal knowing that when your feet are 
tired you don’t have far to go to get back.

Primrose Cottage - A charming 2 bed cottage in the heart of bath, featuring a sun terrace, roll top 
bath, floral Divine Savages Wallpaper and Always Sunday homewares with a primrose pink theme. 
Just a 10 minute walk from the Artisan quarter and a short walk from the Roman Baths.



Periwinkle Cottage - Coming soon.

TOWN+HOUSE | Pub & Restaurant

The little independent pub on the corner known as the local’s favourite for its weekly quiz, creative 
workshops, sell-out brunch menu and the best Sunday roast in Bath.

Sunday Roast - Named the Best Sunday Roast in Bath by locals for a reason and selling out every 
weekend, the Town+House roast menu is packed with local produce, seasonal veg and the most 
deliciously juicy jus in town.

Burgers - Seriously good burgers using the best local produce from Larkhall butchers, handmade 
hokkaido buns crafted by the Town+House chefs and delicious burger combinations to blow your 
socks off.

Drinks - Seasonal cocktail menus with Town+House signatures like the House espresso martini and 
local craft pints on tap, all sampled and adored by our team.

Brunch - Serving the best hash browns in Bath, eggs cooked to perfection and veggie smoky beans 
and greens on our house made toast, the ultimate hangover cure, all crafted by the Town+House 
chefs.

Always Sunday Store
9 Broad Street, Bath, BA1 5LJ
Store Hours: Monday, Wednesday to Saturday 10am-5:30pm | Sunday 11am - 5pm | Closed on Tuesdays
Online: www.alwayssunday.store | Phone: 01225 428 857 | sales@alwayssunday.store
Instagram: @always_sunday_store | Pinterest: @alwayssundaystore | TikTok: @always.sunday.store
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